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“We’re a Verizon Wireless retailer, so 
we own and operate 40 locations in 
four states: South Carolina, Georgia, 
Kentucky, and West Virginia.”

“I perceive the growth in the next five 
years to increase every year, particu-
larly next year we are looking to go 
from 40 stores to 50 stores by the end 
of 2013.”

“The growth of our business has been 
two different pieces. One, we have an 
amazing group of people that work in 
our organization. They are very driven, 
very aggressive. Winning is the only 
option. Failure actually drives us to 
do better the next go around. (And) 
fortunately we’ve had a lot of expan-
sion and a lot of milestones over the 
past four years.”

“In addition to that, the wireless 
industry has evolved and expanded 
tremendously over the past five years. 
We’ve seen network speeds go from 
five to ten times faster, which allows 
the end user to do more things on a 
mobile device — download files, do 
PowerPoint presentations over the air, 
send large files via email. This allows 
business owners and entrepreneurs, 
soccer moms, medical field, construc-
tion — every industry — to be more 
mobile, to more productive on the go.”

“Nowadays you see almost everyone 
with a wireless handset device. And on 
Verizon Wireless.”--

Krish Patel, CEO
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